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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

APAC-Arkansas, Inc. * * * * * * * *

Arkhola Division

Alma, AR

Preston

479-788-6344

APAC-Arkansas, Inc. * * * * * * * *

Arkhola Division

Jenny Lind, AR

479-788-6344

APAC-Arkansas, Inc.

McClinton-Anchor Division

Avoca

479-636-8329

APAC-Arkansas, Inc.

McClinton-Anchor Division

Centerton

479-795-2959

APAC-Arkansas, Inc.

McClinton-Anchor Division

Hindsville

479-789-7190

APAC-Arkansas, Inc. * *
McClinton-Anchor Division

Sharps

479-756-2881

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

Awarded By:  DATE:  

Awarded To:  

NO BID RECEIVED

NO BID

54.00 54.00 **54.00 56.00 58.00 54.5049.50 46.50 49.50 53.00

43.50 47.00 49.50 46.50 49.50 53.00 54.00 56.00 58.00

**

NO BID

(3) (12.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5) (6) (9.5)

ACHM Surface Course

Limestone Aggregate

SECTION 407

Cold Plant Mix

SECTION 411

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

ACHM

Base Course

SECTION 405

ACHM Surface Course

SECTION 407

ACHM

54.50 58.00 59.50

Asphalt Concrete

Binder Course

SECTION 406

(2) (25.0)(1) (37.5)

58.00 59.50

Purchasing Committee

As Per Tabulation

47.35 49.40

54.00

March 12, 2007

**

43.50 47.00

54.00



Page 2

Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

APAC-Arkansas, Inc. * *

McClinton-Anchor Division

Valley Springs

870-429-5296

APAC-Arkansas, Inc.

McClinton-Anchor Division

West Fork

479-839-8514

APAC-Mississippi, Inc. * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

Greenville, MS

662-378-8481

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Forrest City, AR

870-630-1290

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Memphis

901-942-1800

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

West Memphis, AR

870-735-2880

APAC-Tennessee, Inc.

Tillar, AR

870-222-4360

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

NO BID RECEIVED

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

55.00 52.00 55.0052.00 55.00 48.00 52.0052.00 55.00 48.00 48.0052.00 55.00 48.0048.00 52.00 55.00 48.00

53.00

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

55.00 55.0048.00 52.0052.00 55.00 48.00 52.0048.00 52.00 55.00 48.00

49.00 53.00 55.00 49.00

62.8160.73

55.00 51.00 53.00 55.00

57.62 60.73

NO BID

43.60 44.70

62.81

.20/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

62.8157.62

48.00 52.00

55.50 50.5055.00

55.00

SECTION 407

51.50 53.00

57.62 60.73

51.00 53.0055.50

48.00 52.00 55.00

52.50

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

Cold Plant Mix

SECTION 411

**

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

ACHM

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

SECTION 407

ACHM Surface Course

ACHM Surface Course

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

Asphalt Concrete

Base Course Binder Course

ACHM

Limestone Aggregate

62.81

SECTION 405 SECTION 406

(4) (9.5)(1) (37.5) (2) (25.0) (3) (12.5) (6) (9.5)(5) (12.5)

54.35 55.77 57.62 60.7352.21 54.35 55.77 52.21
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Asphalt Products

711 Delta Drive

Little Rock, AR

501-490-0718

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Mountain View

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Batesville Blvd.

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Batesville, AR

Midwest Lane

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Myron, AR

870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

Black Rock, AR

870-932-1246

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

.20040.0039.25 36.25 40.75 43.75 46.50

51.26

68.65

45.00 45.00 47.26 51.26

46.00 50.00 68.65

68.65

43.00 47.00 43.00 47.00 45.85

.20/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

69.00

49.85

47.26

48.00 44.5043.00 43.00 47.0042.00 43.00 41.00 42.00 47.50 48.5041.00

(4) (9.5)

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

(3) (12.5)

Asphalt Concrete

Cold Plant MixLimestone Aggregate

SECTION 405

(2) (25.0)

SECTION 406

Base Course Binder Course

ACHM ACHM

(1) (37.5)

50.65 50.65

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

(6) (9.5)

ACHM Surface Course

ACHM Surface Course

SECTION 407 SECTION 411SECTION 407

40.00

(5) (12.5)

45.00 49.0045.85 49.85

35.75

68.65

47.41 48.10
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Atlas Asphalt, Inc.

102 Bearden Drive

Jonesboro, AR

870-932-1246

R. M. Courson, Inc. * * * * * * * * *
Old College Road

Monticello, AR

870-367-8336

Cranford Construction Co.

Bryant, AR

501-602-5556

Cranford Construction Co.

North Little Rock, AR

501-955-0338

Cranford Construction Co.

Little Rock, AR

501-490-1750

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Black Rock, AR

870-878-6307

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Bee Branch

501-745-3693

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

50.50

45.00 .18047.00 44.00 47.0044.00 47.00 44.00

.15/tn per 
mile 

w/3.50 
min.

55.00

.15/tn per 
mile 

w/3.50 
min.

55.0050.50

.15/tn per 
mile 

w/3.50 
min.

36.80 39.60 40.50 39.30 42.50 44.15 43.40 44.70

55.0047.60 51.0042.95 44.65 43.90 47.7537.30 40.10 41.00 39.80

53.35 57.90

.200

47.30 50.30 49.25 51.55 51.15 55.60

50.00 41.2541.2536.75 40.25 43.75 37.50 41.75 46.75 43.25 46.25

39.50 40.25 39.50 42.50 47.25 42.50

45.20

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

50.5036.80 39.60 40.50 39.30

49.10

43.00

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

SECTION 405 SECTION 406

ACHM Surface Course

ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate

Asphalt Concrete

Cold Plant Mix

(2) (25.0) (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5)

42.50 44.15 42.00 47.25

40.75

ACHM ACHM

Base Course Binder Course

48.50 42.50 49.10

(5) (12.5)

44.0045.00

49.00

(1) (37.5)

47.25 48.50

68.25

SECTION 407

(6) (9.5)

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

SECTION 411SECTION 407
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Judsonia, AR

501-729-4601

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Luxora, AR

870-658-2543

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Paragould, AR

870-239-3085

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas

Tuckerman, AR

870-349-2995

Dequeen Sand & Gravel * *
Company, Inc.

Dequeen, AR

870-642-2266

Drummond Asphalt

Construction, Inc.

750 Drummond Lane

Wynne, AR  72396

870-238-9331

Eaton Excavating, Inc.

Harrison

870-365-8473

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

62.50 62.50 .180

49.50

51.50 50.00 52.00 54.0053.50 50.00 52.00 54.00 49.75 51.50

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

48.75 50.75 51.25 48.75 50.75 52.75 49.75

55.00 .180

51.00 57.50

47.0047.00 47.00

.180

47.00

45.0044.00

.180

44.00 47.00 44.00 47.00 44.00 45.00

52.00 52.0052.00 55.00

43.00 50.5039.50 44.00

52.00 55.00

SECTION 411

Asphalt Concrete

44.00 41.50 49.0039.50

55.00

(1) (37.5)

SECTION 405

52.00

(6) (9.5)(5) (12.5)

ACHM Surface Course

ACHM Surface Course Limestone Aggregate

SECTION 406 SECTION 407 SECTION 407

(2) (25.0) (3) (12.5) (4) (9.5)

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

ACHM ACHM

Base Course Binder Course

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

52.00

47.00

Cold Plant Mix

53.50

49.50
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Edwards Brothers, Inc.

Violet Hill, AR

870-322-7113

R. K. Hall Construction, LTD

Texarkana, AR

870-773-0829

Hutchens Construction Co. * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Jane, MO

Bella Vista Plant

417-226-4806

Hutchens Construction * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Company

Berryville, AR

870-423-4318

Hutchens Construction * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Company

Springdale, AR

479-927-0257

Jay-Pac, Inc.

Hartman

479-754-0372

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

45.75

41.00

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/2.50 
min.

48.00 52.00 55.0055.00 41.00 48.00 52.0052.00 55.00 44.00 52.0044.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

46.50 49.75 50.50 47.00 51.00 52.00 53.00 57.00 58.50 52.00 .200

69.00 69.0047.00

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/2.50 
min.

46.00

47.00 55.00 58.00

ACHM Surface Course

SECTION 407

Cold Plant Mix

SECTION 411

58.00 55.0045.00 53.00 56.00 45.00 53.00 56.0047.00 55.00

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

ACHM

(1) (37.5)

SECTION 407

55.0053.0047.00 56.00 45.00 53.0058.00 45.00 56.0055.00

47.00 55.00 58.00

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/2.50 
min.

Base Course

Asphalt Concrete

SECTION 405 SECTION 406

ACHM

(4) (9.5) (6) (9.5)(2) (25.0) (3) (12.5)

ACHM Surface Course

Binder Course Limestone Aggregate

(5) (12.5)
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Jay-Pac, Inc.

Plummerville, AR

501-354-4175

Jet Asphalt & Rock * * * *
Company, Inc.

Camden, AR

870-574-1840

Jet Asphalt & Rock * * * * * * * *
Company, Inc.

Eagle Mills, AR

870-574-0691

Jet Asphalt & Rock * * * * * * * * *
Company, Inc.

El Dorado, AR

870-862-4830 - Plant

870-863-7801 - Office

Kiewit Southern Company

Sonora, AR

479-927-2712

Leo Journagan * *~ *~ * *~ *~ * *~ *~ * *~ *~
Construction Company, Inc.

Highway 65/Tower Road

Omaha Quarry

870-426-3780

Leo Journagan * *~ *~ * *~ *~ * *~ *~ * *~ *~
Construction Company, Inc.

Hollister, MO

417-337-8872

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

~MINIMUM 500 TONS

52.00 46.00 51.00 56.0042.00 47.0040.00 44.00 47.00 41.00 45.00 48.00

.26/tn per 
mile 

w/2.00 
min.

NO BID RECEIVED

.26/tn per 
mile 

w/2.00 
min.

56.00 41.00 45.00 48.0042.00 47.00 46.00 51.00

55.00 55.00 60.00 62.00

.18/tn per 
mile 

w/100.00 
per load 

min.

55.00 62.00

.18/tn per 
mile 

w/100.00 
per load 

min.

50.00 55.00 50.00

60.00 55.00

62.0055.00

.18/tn per 
mile 

w/100.00 
per load 

min.

50.00 55.00 50.00 55.00 55.00

65.00 65.00

55.00

46.0046.00

60.00

52.00

62.00

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

Limestone AggregateBase Course Binder Course ACHM Surface Course

ACHMACHM

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

SECTION 407

(3) (12.5)(1) (37.5) (2) (25.0) (4) (9.5)

SECTION 405 SECTION 406 SECTION 407

(6) (9.5)(5) (12.5)

40.00 44.00 47.00

SECTION 411

Asphalt Concrete

Cold Plant Mix

ACHM Surface Course
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

Martin Marietta * * * * * * * * * * * *

Materials, Inc.

Jones Mill

501-844-4707

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel * * * * * * * * * *

Company

Kansas Street & River

870-534-7120

R. D. Plant Contracting

Company, Inc.

Murfreesboro, AR

870-285-3151

Rogers Group, Inc.

Conway, AR

501-329-8381

Rogers Group, Inc.

Greenbrier, AR

501-679-6230

Rogers Group, Inc.

Cabot, AR

501-843-5145

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

38.25 40.80 41.45 39.60 42.40 43.30 43.55 47.10

43.40 48.90 46.43 52.12 59.50 57.95 57.95

Limestone Aggregate

SECTION 411

Cold Plant Mix

62.50

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

Asphalt ConcreteACHM Surface Course

SECTION 407

ACHM

SECTION 406 SECTION 407

(6) (9.5)(1) (37.5) (4) (9.5) (5) (12.5)

56.70

48.25

51.30 48.00

46.55 52.25

52.50 57.50

(2) (25.0) (3) (12.5)

Base Course Binder Course

ACHM

ACHM Surface Course

SECTION 405

63.00 63.0038.50 41.00 42.00 41.00 44.00 45.65 46.00 49.25 50.50 47.00 50.85 53.00

.20/tn per 
mile 

w/2.75 
min.

38.50 41.00 42.00 41.00 44.00 45.65 45.00 48.25 49.50 46.00 50.50 52.00

.20/tn per 
mile 

w/2.75 
min.

38.50 41.00 42.00 41.00 44.00 45.65 45.00 48.25 49.50 46.00 50.50 52.00

.20/tn per 
mile 

w/2.75 
min.
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Haul Rate

(7) (8) Per Ton-

BIDDERS PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 PG64-22 PG70-22 PG76-22 MC-800 Cutback Summer Grade Per Mile

E. C. Rowlett Construction

Company, Inc.

North Little Rock, AR

501-753-6604

Twin Lakes Quarrys, Inc. * * * * *

Mountain Home, AR

870-425-4510

White River Materials

Mt. View, AR

870-269-7222

Jack Wood Construction

Company, Inc.

Russellville, AR

479-968-1149

*SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY

**SEE ATTACHED SHEET

43.50 43.50

55.0036.80 39.60 40.50 39.30 42.50 44.15 43.40 47.25 48.50

65.00

.25/tn per 
mile 

w/3.00 
min.

44.70

57.0041.00 46.00 65.00

49.10 50.50

50.00 43.00 47.00 51.00 47.50 53.50

43.50

NO BID RECEIVED

.15/tn per 
mile 

w/3.50 
min.

Asphalt Concrete

Cold Plant Mix

Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

SECTION 411

ACHM Surface Course

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H

(6) (9.5)

SECTION 405 SECTION 406

ACHM ACHM

Base Course Binder Course

SECTION 407

49.00 55.00

(1) (37.5) (2) (25.0)

60.00

(3) (12.5) (4) (9.5)

SECTION 407

(5) (12.5)

ACHM Surface Course

Limestone Aggregate

.330

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT

43.50



Page 10
Date of Contract:  4/1/2007 thru 9/30/2007                  Opening Date:  March 6, 2007

TABULATION OF SUPPLY CONTRACT NO. H-07-069H
ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY AND TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT


